

Racine County Board of Drainage Commissioners (RCBDC)
Farm No. 1 – Tile Replacement
BID DATE & TIME: January 23 AT 11:15 am

NOTE: Bid Tabs will be posted after the Owner has reviewed them.

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: None

Contractor	Drain Tile No. 1	Drain Tile No. 2	Drain Tile No. 2 Alt. Bid	Drain Tile No. 3 – Phase 1	Drain Tile No. 3 Phase 2	Drain Tile No. 4
All – Ways Contractors						
AW Oakes						
Dolson, Inc.						
Globe Contractors	\$73,271.00	\$222,522.00	\$238,660.00	\$239,810.00	\$340,986.00	\$250,682.00
Kartechner Bros.	\$27,540.90	\$90,649.58	\$67,120.92	\$134,067.06	\$192,029.26	\$109,675.50
Krause Excavating						
Musson Bros.						
RJ Underground						
RLP Diversified	NO BID	\$248,006.00	\$231,598.00	\$214,027.70	\$289,776.18	NO BID
Reesman's Excavating	\$96,153.50	\$155,047.00	\$125,844.00	\$196,625.30	\$269,932.80	\$171,471.75
Roman's Grading	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$225,000.00	\$185,000.00

Contractor	Drain Tile No. 1	Drain Tile No. 2	Drain Tile No. 2 Alt Bid	Drain Tile No. 3 – Phase 1	Drain Title No. 3 – Phase 2	Drain Tile No. 4
Wanasek Corp.						
Willkomm Exc.						