

RACINE COUNTY BOARD OF DRAINAGE COMMISSIONERS
Norway / Dover and Yorkville/ Raymond Drainage District Debrushing Project - REBID
BID DATE & TIME: December 22, 2016 AT 11:00 AM

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: None
Apparent Low Bidder:

| | Contract 1 | Contract 2 | Contract 3 | Contract 4 | Contract 5 | Contract 6 | Contract 7 | Contract 8 | Contract 9 |
|-----------------------------|---------------------|--------------------|---------------------|---------------------|--------------------|---------------------|---------------------|---------------------|---------------------|
| Bradford Contractors | \$160,406.20 | \$36,039.05 | \$126,090.50 | \$77,897.50 | \$44,004.00 | \$70,265.00 | \$125,570.00 | \$93,055.00 | \$85,215.00 |
| Drax Co. | \$99,825.00 | \$14,382.00 | \$139,064.00 | \$65,787.00 | \$30,506.00 | \$44,822.50 | \$88,693.50 | \$56,210.00 | \$48,510.00 |
| Grassman | \$102,132.50 | No Bid | \$113,618.00 | \$71,347.00 | \$39,520.00 | \$53,500.00 | No Bid | No Bid | \$73,790.00 |
| Gunderson Excavating | \$87,162.00 | \$27,679.00 | \$88,896.00 | \$50,046.00 | \$26,312.00 | \$41,941.00 | \$104,240.00 | \$54,957.00 | \$45,096.00 |
| Homer Tree Service | \$143,831.72 | \$69,160.76 | \$171,248.81 | \$94,739.18 | \$53,802.64 | \$86,141.21 | \$171,053.90 | \$99,352.22 | \$76,089.28 |
| Ray Hintz | \$182,268.27 | \$43,699.02 | \$173,333.30 | \$82,226.48 | \$43,588.54 | \$74,205.67 | \$260,918.18 | \$126,517.73 | \$127,246.24 |
| RLP Diversified | \$103,309.00 | \$22,850.00 | \$119,085.00 | \$55,714.00 | \$44,520.00 | \$49,358.00 | No Bid | \$66,869.00 | \$36,973.00 |
| Romans Grading | \$280,000.00 | \$60,000.00 | \$285,000.00 | \$150,000.00 | \$65,000.00 | \$115,000.00 | \$205,000.00 | \$130,000.00 | \$100,000.00 |
| Western Contracting | \$196,531.25 | \$76,415.00 | \$223,425.00 | \$135,830.50 | \$66,283.00 | \$108,743.00 | \$210,261.00 | \$127,740.75 | \$123,426.00 |